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Registration Statement No. 333-149632

CALCULATION OF REGISTRATION FEE

Maximum Maximum Amount of
Title of Each Class of Amount to be Offering Aggregate Registration

Securities to be Registered Registered(1)
Price Per
Unit Offering Price Fee(1)(2)

5.150% Notes due 2018 $ 900,000,000 99.794% $ 898,146,000 $ 35,297
5.850% Notes due 2038 $ 700,000,000 99.952% $ 699,664,000 $ 27,497
Total $ 62,794

(1) Calculated in accordance with Rule 457(r) under the Securities Act of 1933 (the �Securities Act�).
Prospectus Supplement
(to Prospectus dated March 11, 2008)

$900,000,000 5.15% Notes due 2018

$700,000,000 5.85% Notes due 2038

Interest payable January 15 and July 15

Johnson & Johnson will pay interest on the Notes on January 15 and July 15 of each year. The first such payment will
be made on January 15, 2009. The Notes will be issued in minimum denominations of $2,000 and additional
increments of $1,000. Johnson & Johnson may redeem some or all of the Notes at any time at the make-whole
redemption prices described in this Prospectus Supplement. Our principal office is located at One Johnson & Johnson
Plaza, New Brunswick, NJ 08933. Our telephone number is (732) 524-0400.

Neither the Securities and Exchange Commission nor any State Securities Commission has approved or disapproved
of the Notes or determined that this Prospectus Supplement or the attached Prospectus is accurate or complete. Any
representation to the contrary is a criminal offense.

Price to Underwriting Proceeds to Us,
Public Discount Before Expenses

Per 5.15% Note 99.794% 0.450% 99.344%
Total $ 898,146,000 $ 4,050,000 $ 894,096,000
Per 5.85% Note 99.952% 0.875% 99.077%
Total $ 699,664,000 $ 6,125,000 $ 693,539,000

We expect to deliver the Notes in book-entry form only through the facilities of The Depository Trust Company and
its participants, including Euroclear and Clearstream, against payment on or about June 23, 2008.

Joint Book-Running Managers
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Goldman, Sachs & Co. JPMorgan

Citi Deutsche Bank Securities

Senior Co-Managers

Banc of America Securities LLC
  Morgan Stanley

The Williams Capital Group, L.P.
Co-Managers

BNP PARIBAS
     HSBC

Mitsubishi UFJ Securities
          RBS Greenwich Capital

June 18, 2008
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In making your investment decision, you should rely only on the information contained or incorporated by reference
in this Prospectus Supplement and the attached Prospectus. We have not authorized anyone to provide you with any
other information. If you receive any unauthorized information, you must not rely on it.

We are offering to sell the Notes only in places where sales are permitted.

You should not assume that the information contained or incorporated by reference in this Prospectus Supplement or
the attached Prospectus is accurate as of any date other than its respective date.

S-2
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Forward-Looking Statements

This Prospectus contains �forward-looking statements� as defined in the Private Securities Litigation Reform Act of
1995. These statements are based on current expectations of future events. If underlying assumptions prove inaccurate
or unknown risks or uncertainties materialize, actual results could vary materially from Johnson & Johnson�s
expectations and projections. Risks and uncertainties include general industry conditions and competition, economic
conditions, such as interest rate and currency exchange rate fluctuations; technological advances and patents attained
by competitors; challenges inherent in new product development, including obtaining regulatory approvals; domestic
and foreign health care reforms and governmental laws and regulations; and trends toward health care cost
containment. A further list and description of these risks, uncertainties and other factors can be found in Exhibit 99 of
the Company�s Annual Report on Form 10-K for the fiscal year ended December 30, 2007. Copies of this Form 10-K,
as well as subsequent filings, are available online at www.sec.gov, www.jnj.com or on request from Johnson &
Johnson. Johnson & Johnson does not undertake to update any forward-looking statements as a result of new
information or future events or developments.

Where You Can Find More Information

We file annual, quarterly and special reports, proxy statements and other information with the SEC. Our SEC filings
are available to the public over the Internet at the SEC�s web site at www.sec.gov. You may also read and copy any
document we file at the SEC�s public reference room at 450 Fifth Street, N.W., Washington, D.C., 20549. Please call
the SEC at 1-800-SEC-0330 for further information on the public reference room.

The SEC allows us to incorporate by reference the information we file with them, which means that we can disclose
important information to you by referring you to those documents. The information incorporated by reference is
considered to be part of this Prospectus, and information that we file later with the SEC will automatically update and
supersede this information. We incorporate by reference the documents listed below and any future filings made with
the SEC under Sections 13(a), 13(c), 14, or 15(d) of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, until we complete our
offering of the Notes:

� Annual Report on Form 10-K for the year ended December 30, 2007;

� Quarterly Report on Form 10-Q for the quarter ended March 30, 2008;

� Current Reports on Form 8-K dated January 14, 2008 and April 24, 2008.

You may request a copy of these filings at no cost, by writing or telephoning us at the following address.

Corporate Secretary�s Office
Johnson & Johnson
One Johnson & Johnson Plaza
New Brunswick, NJ 08933
(732) 524-2455

S-3
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Use of Proceeds

Johnson & Johnson intends to use the net proceeds of the offering of Notes for general corporate purposes.

Ratio of Earnings to Fixed Charges

The ratio of earnings to fixed charges represents our historical ratio and is calculated on a total enterprise basis. The
ratio is computed by dividing the sum of earnings before provision for taxes and fixed charges (excluding capitalized
interest) by fixed charges. Fixed charges represent interest (including capitalized interest) and amortization of debt
discount and expense and the interest factor of all rentals, consisting of an appropriate interest factor on operating
leases.

Three months
ended Fiscal year ended

March 30, December 30, December 31, January 1, January 1, December 28,
2008 2007 2006 2006 2005 2003

Ratio of Earnings to
Fixed Charges 30.91 25.96 53.42 53.44 30.89 24.68

S-4
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Description of the Notes

The following description of the particular terms of the Notes offered hereby supplements, and to the extent
inconsistent therewith replaces, the description of the general terms and provisions of the Debt Securities set forth
under the heading �Description of Debt Securities� in the accompanying Prospectus, to which description reference is
hereby made.

General

The Notes offered hereby will be our unsecured obligations and will be issued under an Indenture dated as of
September 15, 1987 between us and The Bank of New York Trust Company, N.A. (as successor to BNY Midwest
Trust Company which succeeded Harris Trust and Savings Bank), Chicago, Illinois, as trustee (the �Trustee�), as
amended by a First Supplemental Indenture dated as of September 1, 1990 (the �Indenture�). The 5.15% Notes will
mature on July 15, 2018, and the 5.85% Notes will mature on July 15, 2038.

The Notes will bear interest from June 23, 2008 or from the most recent interest payment date to which interest has
been paid or provided for, payable semiannually on January 15 and July 15 of each year, beginning January 15, 2009,
to the beneficial owners of the Notes at the close of business on the applicable record date, which is the January 1 or
July 1 next preceding such interest payment date. The 5.15% Notes will bear interest at the rate of 5.15% per annum,
and the 5.85% Notes will bear interest at the rate of 5.85% per annum.

The Notes will be entitled to the benefits of our covenants described under the caption �Description of Debt
Securities�Certain Covenants� in the accompanying Prospectus.

Notes will be issued in minimum denominations of $2,000 and additional increments of $1,000. The Notes do not
have the benefit of a sinking fund.

Optional Redemption

Johnson & Johnson may redeem the Notes at its option at any time, either in whole or in part upon at least 30 days,
but not more than 60 days, prior notice given by mail to the registered address of each Holder of the Notes to be
redeemed. If Johnson & Johnson elects to redeem the Notes, it will pay a redemption price equal to the greater of the
following amounts, plus, in each case, accrued and unpaid interest thereon to, but not including, the redemption date:

� 100% of the aggregate principal amount of the Notes to be redeemed on the redemption date; or

� the sum of the present values of the Remaining Scheduled Payments.

In determining the present values of the Remaining Scheduled Payments, Johnson & Johnson will discount such
payments to the redemption date on a semi-annual basis (assuming a 360-day year consisting of twelve 30-day
months) using a discount rate equal to the Treasury Rate plus 0.15% in the case of the 5.15% Notes and 0.20% in the
case of the 5.85% Notes.

The following terms are relevant to the determination of the redemption price.

�Treasury Rate� means, with respect to any redemption date, the rate per annum equal to the semi-annual equivalent
yield to maturity (computed as of the third business day immediately preceding that redemption date) of the
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Johnson & Johnson will assume a price for the Comparable Treasury Issue (expressed as a percentage of its principal
amount) equal to the Comparable Treasury Price for such redemption date.

�Comparable Treasury Issue� means the United States Treasury security selected by an Independent Investment
Banker as having an actual or interpolated maturity comparable to the remaining term of the Notes to be redeemed
that would be utilized, at the time of selection and in accordance with customary financial practice, in pricing new
issues of corporate debt securities of comparable maturity to the remaining term of such Notes.

�Independent Investment Banker� means Goldman, Sachs & Co., J.P. Morgan Securities Inc., Citigroup Global
Markets Inc. or Deutsche Bank Securities Inc. or their respective successors as may be appointed from time to time by
Johnson & Johnson; provided, however, that if any of the foregoing ceases to be a primary U.S. Government
securities dealer in New York City (a �primary treasury dealer�), Johnson & Johnson will substitute another primary
treasury dealer.

�Comparable Treasury Price� means, with respect to any redemption date, (1) the arithmetic average of four
Reference Treasury Dealer Quotations for such redemption date after excluding the highest and lowest Reference
Treasury Dealer Quotations, or (2) if the Trustee obtains fewer than four Reference Treasury Dealer Quotations, the
arithmetic average of all Reference Treasury Dealer Quotations for such redemption date.

�Reference Treasury Dealer Quotations� means, with respect to each Reference Treasury Dealer and any redemption
date, the arithmetic average, as determined by the Trustee, of the bid and asked prices for the Comparable Treasury
Issue (expressed in each case as a percentage of its principal amount) quoted in writing to the Trustee by such
Reference Treasury Dealer as of 5:00 p.m., New York City time, on the third business day preceding such redemption
date.

�Reference Treasury Dealer� means Goldman, Sachs & Co., J.P. Morgan Securities Inc., Citigroup Global Markets
Inc. and Deutsche Bank Securities Inc., and each of their respective successors and any other primary treasury dealers
selected by Johnson & Johnson.

�Remaining Scheduled Payments� means, with respect to any Note to be redeemed, the remaining scheduled
payments of the principal thereof and interest thereon that would be due after the related redemption date but for such
redemption; provided, however, that, if such redemption date is not an interest payment date with respect to such
Note, the amount of the next scheduled interest payment thereon will be reduced by the amount of interest accrued
thereon to such redemption date.

A partial redemption of the Notes may be effected by such method as the Trustee may deem fair and appropriate and
may provide for the selection for redemption of portions (equal to the minimum authorized denomination for the
Notes or any integral multiple thereof) of the principal amount of Notes of a denomination larger than the minimum
authorized denomination for the Notes. If less than all of the Notes are to be redeemed, the Notes to be redeemed shall
be selected by the Trustee by a method the Trustee deems to be fair and appropriate.

Notice of any redemption will be mailed at least 30 days but not more than 60 days before the redemption date to each
holder of the Notes to be redeemed. Once notice of redemption is mailed, the Notes called for redemption will become
due and payable on the redemption date and at the applicable redemption price, plus accrued and unpaid interest to the
redemption date.

Unless Johnson & Johnson defaults in payment of the redemption price, on and after the redemption date interest will
cease to accrue on the Notes, or portions thereof, called for
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redemption. On or before the redemption date, Johnson & Johnson will deposit with the paying agent (or the Trustee)
money sufficient to pay the redemption price of and accrued interest on the Notes to be redeemed on that date.

Further Issues

We may from time to time, without notice to, or the consent of, the registered holders of any series of Notes, create
and issue further notes equal in rank to any series of the Notes offered by this Prospectus Supplement in all respects
(or in all respects except for the payment of interest accruing prior to the issue date of the further notes or except for
the first payment of interest following the issue date of the further notes). These further notes may be consolidated and
form a single series with any existing series of Notes and will have the same terms as to status, redemption or
otherwise as that existing series of Notes.

Book-Entry System

The Notes will be issued in fully registered form and will be represented by a global certificate or certificates (the
�Global Security�) registered in the name of a nominee of The Depository Trust Company (�DTC� or the �Depositary�). The
Global Security representing the Notes will be deposited with, or on behalf of, the Depositary. Investors may elect to
hold interests in the Global Security through the Depositary, Clearstream Banking, Societe Anonyme, which we refer
to as �Clearstream, Luxembourg,� or Euroclear Bank S.A./N.V., as operator of the Euroclear System, which we refer to
as �Euroclear,� if they are participants in such systems, or indirectly through organizations which are participants in
such systems. Clearstream, Luxembourg and Euroclear will hold interests on behalf of their participants through
customers� securities accounts in Clearstream, Luxembourg�s and Euroclear�s names on the books of their respective
depositaries, which in turn will hold such interests in customers� securities accounts in the depositaries� names on the
books of the Depositary. Citibank, N.A. will act as depositary for Clearstream, Luxembourg and JPMorgan Chase
Bank will act as depositary for Euroclear, which we refer to in such capacities as the �U.S. Depositaries.� The Notes will
not be exchangeable for certificates issued in definitive, registered form (�Certificated Notes�) at the option of the holder
and, except as set forth below, will not otherwise be issuable in definitive form.

DTC has advised us and the underwriters as follows: DTC is a limited-purpose trust company organized under the
New York Banking Law, a �banking organization� within the meaning of the New York Banking Law, a member of the
Federal Reserve System, a �clearing corporation� within the meaning of the New York Uniform Commercial Code and
a �clearing agency� registered pursuant to the provisions of Section 17A of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934.
DTC holds securities that its participants (�Participants�) deposit with DTC. DTC also facilitates the settlement among
Participants of securities transactions, such as transfers and pledges, in deposited securities through electronic
computerized book-entry changes in Participants� accounts, thereby eliminating the need for physical movement of
securities certificates. �Direct Participants� include securities brokers and dealers, banks, trust companies, clearing
corporations, and certain other organizations. Access to the DTC system is also available to others such as securities
brokers and dealers, banks, and trust companies that clear through or maintain a custodial relationship with a Direct
Participant, either directly or indirectly (�Indirect Participants�). The rules applicable to DTC and its Participants are on
file with the Securities and Exchange Commission. More information about DTC can be found at www.dtc.org or
www.dtcc.com.

S-7
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Clearstream, Luxembourg advises that it is incorporated under the laws of Luxembourg as a bank. Clearstream,
Luxembourg holds securities for its customers, which we refer to as �Clearstream, Luxembourg Customers,� and
facilitates the clearance and settlement of securities transactions between Clearstream, Luxembourg Customers
through electronic book-entry transfers between their accounts. Clearstream, Luxembourg provides to Clearstream,
Luxembourg Customers, among other things, services for safekeeping, administration, clearance and settlement of
internationally traded securities and securities lending and borrowing. Clearstream, Luxembourg interfaces with
domestic securities markets in over 30 countries through established depository and custodial relationships. As a bank,
Clearstream, Luxembourg is subject to regulation by the Luxembourg Commission for the Supervision of the
Financial Sector, also known as the Commission de Surveillance du Secteur Financier. Clearstream, Luxembourg
Customers are recognized financial institutions around the world, including underwriters, securities brokers and
dealers, banks, trust companies, clearing corporations and certain other organizations. Clearstream, Luxembourg
Customers in the United States are limited to securities brokers and dealers and banks. Indirect access to Clearstream,
Luxembourg is also available to other institutions such as banks, brokers, dealers and trust companies that clear
through or maintain a custodial relationship with a Clearstream, Luxembourg Customer.

Distributions with respect to the Notes held through Clearstream, Luxembourg will be credited to cash accounts of
Clearstream, Luxembourg Customers in accordance with its rules and procedures, to the extent received by the
U.S. Depositary of Clearstream, Luxembourg.

Euroclear advises that it was created in 1968 to hold securities for its participants, which we refer to as �Euroclear
Participants,� and to clear and settle transactions between Euroclear Participants through simultaneous electronic
book-entry delivery against payment, thereby eliminating the need for physical movement of certificates and any risk
from lack of simultaneous transfers of securities and cash. Euroclear provides various other services, including
securities lending and borrowing and interfaces with domestic markets in several countries. Euroclear is operated by
Euroclear Bank S.A./N.V., which we refer to as the �Euroclear Operator,� under contract with Euroclear Clearance
Systems, S.C., a Belgian cooperative corporation, which we refer to as the �Cooperative.� All operations are conducted
by the Euroclear Operator, and all Euroclear securities clearance accounts and Euroclear cash accounts are accounts
with the Euroclear Operator, not the Cooperative. The Cooperative establishes policy for Euroclear on behalf of
Euroclear Participants. Euroclear Participants include banks, including central banks, securities brokers and dealers
and other professional financial intermediaries and may include the underwriters. Indirect access to Euroclear is also
available to other firms that clear through or maintain a custodial relationship with a Euroclear Participant, either
directly or indirectly.

Securities clearance accounts and cash accounts with the Euroclear Operator are governed by the Terms and
Conditions Governing Use of Euroclear and the related Operating Procedures of the Euroclear System, and applicable
Belgian law, which we refer to collectively as the �Terms and Conditions.� The Terms and Conditions govern transfers
of securities and cash within Euroclear, withdrawals of securities and cash from Euroclear, and receipts of payments
with respect to securities in Euroclear. All securities in Euroclear are held on a fungible basis without attribution of
specific certificates to specific securities clearance accounts. The Euroclear Operator acts under the Terms and
Conditions only on behalf of Euroclear Participants and has no record of or relationship with persons holding through
Euroclear Participants.

S-8
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Distributions with respect to the Notes held beneficially through Euroclear will be credited to the cash accounts of
Euroclear Participants in accordance with the Terms and Conditions, to the extent received by the U.S. Depositary for
Euroclear.

Euroclear further advises that investors that acquire, hold and transfer interests in the Notes by book-entry through
accounts with the Euroclear Operator or any other securities intermediary are subject to the laws and contractual
provisions governing their relationship with their intermediary, as well as the laws and contractual provisions
governing the relationship between such an intermediary and each other intermediary, if any, standing between
themselves and the Global Security.

The Euroclear Operator advises that under Belgian law, investors that are credited with securities on the records of the
Euroclear Operator have a co-property right in the fungible pool of interests in securities on deposit with the Euroclear
Operator in an amount equal to the amount of interests in securities credited to their accounts. In the event of the
insolvency of the Euroclear Operator, Euroclear Participants would have a right under Belgian law to the return of the
amount and type of interests in securities credited to their accounts with the Euroclear Operator. If the Euroclear
Operator did not have a sufficient amount of interests in securities on deposit of a particular type to cover the claims
of all Euroclear Participants credited with such interests in securities on the Euroclear Operator�s records, all
Participants having an amount of interests in securities of such type credited to their accounts with the Euroclear
Operator would have the right under Belgian law to the return of their pro rata share of the amount of interest in
securities actually on deposit.

The Euroclear Operator advises under Belgian law, the Euroclear Operator is required to pass on the benefits of
ownership in any interests in securities on deposit with it, such as dividends, voting rights and other entitlements, to
any person credited with such interests in securities on its records.

Purchases of Notes under the DTC system must be made by or through Direct Participants. Upon the issuance by us of
the Notes, DTC will credit, on its book-entry system, the respective principal amounts of the Notes to the accounts of
Participants. The accounts to be credited shall be designated by the underwriters. The ownership interest of each
actual purchaser of each Note (a �Beneficial Owner�) will be recorded on the Direct and Indirect Participants� records.
Beneficial Owners will not receive written confirmation from DTC of their purchase, but Beneficial Owners are
expected to receive written confirmations providing details of the transaction, as well as periodic statements of their
holdings, from the Direct or Indirect Participant through which the Beneficial Owners entered into the transaction.
Transfers of ownership interests in the Notes are expected to be effected by entries made on the books of Participants
acting on behalf of Beneficial Owners. Beneficial Owners will not receive certificates representing their ownership
interests in Notes, except as set forth below. To facilitate subsequent transfers, all Notes deposited by Participants
with DTC will be registered in the name of DTC�s partnership nominee, Cede & Co. The deposit of Notes with DTC
and their registration in the name of Cede & Co. will not effect any change in beneficial ownership. The laws of some
states require that certain purchasers of securities take physical delivery of such securities in definitive form. Such
laws may impair the ability to transfer beneficial interests in the Global Security.

Title to book-entry interests in the Notes will pass by book-entry registration of the transfer within the records of
Clearstream, Luxembourg, Euroclear or DTC, as the case may be, in accordance with their respective procedures.
Book-entry interests in the Notes may be transferred within Clearstream, Luxembourg and within Euroclear and
between Clearstream,
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Luxembourg and Euroclear in accordance with procedures established for these purposes by Clearstream,
Luxembourg and Euroclear. Book-entry interests in the Notes may be transferred within DTC in accordance with
procedures established for this purpose by DTC. Transfers of book-entry interests in the Notes among Clearstream,
Luxembourg and Euroclear and DTC may be effected in accordance with procedures established for this purpose by
Clearstream, Luxembourg, Euroclear and DTC.

So long as the Depositary for the Global Security, or its nominee, is the registered owner of the Global Security, the
Depositary or its nominee, as the case may be, will be considered the sole owner or holder of the Notes for all
purposes under the Indenture. Except as provided below, Beneficial Owners of the Notes will not be entitled to have
the Notes registered in their names, will not receive or be entitled to receive physical delivery of Notes in definitive
form and will not be considered the owners or holders thereof under the Indenture. Unless and until it is exchanged in
whole or in part for individual certificates evidencing the Notes represented thereby, the Global Security may not be
transferred except as a whole by the Depositary for the Global Security to a nominee of such Depositary or by a
nominee of such Depositary to such Depositary or another nominee of such Depositary or by the Depositary or any
nominee to a successor Depositary or any nominee of such successor.

We expect that conveyance of notices and other communications by the Depositary to Direct Participants, by Direct
Participants to Indirect Participants, and by Direct Participants and Indirect Participants to Beneficial Owners will be
governed by arrangements among them, subject to any statutory or regulatory requirements as may be in effect from
time to time. In addition, neither the Depositary nor Cede & Co. will consent or vote with respect to Notes. We have
been advised that the Depositary�s usual procedure is to mail an omnibus proxy to us as soon as possible after the
record date with respect to such consent or vote. The omnibus proxy would assign Cede & Co.�s consenting or voting
rights to those Direct Participants to whose accounts the Notes are credited on such record date (identified in a listing
attached to the omnibus proxy).

Until the Notes are paid or payment thereof is duly provided for, we will, at all times, maintain a paying agent in The
City of New York capable of performing the duties described herein to be performed by the Paying Agent. We have
appointed the Trustee as Paying Agent. The office of the Paying Agent in The City of New York for all purposes
relating to the Notes is located at the date hereof at 101 Barclay Street, New York, New York 10286.

Payments of principal of and interest, if any, on the Notes registered in the name of the Depositary or its nominee will
be made by us through the Paying Agent to the Depositary or its nominee, as the case may be, as the registered owner
of the Global Security. Neither we, the Trustee, any Paying Agent nor the registrar for the Notes will have any
responsibility or liability for any aspect of the records relating to or payments made on account of beneficial
ownership interests in the Global Security or for maintaining, supervising or reviewing any records relating to such
beneficial ownership interests.

We have been advised that the Depositary will credit the accounts of Direct Participants with payment in amounts
proportionate to their respective holdings in principal amount of interest in the Global Security as shown on the
records of the Depositary. We have been advised that the Depositary�s practice is to credit Direct Participants� accounts
on the applicable payment date unless the Depositary has reason to believe that it will not receive payment on such
date. We expect that payments by Participants to Beneficial Owners will be governed by standing customer
instructions and customary practices, as is now the case with securities held for the accounts of customers. Such
payments will be the responsibility of such Participants.
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If the Depositary with respect to the Global Security is at any time unwilling or unable to continue as Depositary and a
successor Depositary is not appointed by us within 90 days, we will issue Certificated Notes in exchange for the Notes
represented by such Global Security. In addition, we may at any time and in our sole discretion determine not to use
the Depositary�s book-entry system, and, in such event, we will issue Certificated Notes in exchange for the Notes
represented by such Global Security.

Global Clearance and Settlement Procedures

Initial settlement for the Notes will be made in immediately available funds. Secondary market trading between DTC
participants will occur in the ordinary way in accordance with the Depositary�s rules and will be settled in immediately
available funds using the Depositary�s Same-Day Funds Settlement System. Secondary market trading between
Clearstream, Luxembourg Customers and/or Euroclear Participants will occur in the ordinary way in accordance with
the applicable rules and operating procedures of Clearstream, Luxembourg and Euroclear and will be settled using the
procedures applicable to conventional Eurobonds in immediately available funds.

Cross-market transfers between persons holding directly or indirectly through the Depositary on the one hand, and
directly or indirectly through Clearstream, Luxembourg Customers or Euroclear Participants, on the other, will be
effected in the Depositary in accordance with the Depositary�s rules on behalf of the relevant European international
clearing system by its U.S. Depositary; however, such cross-market transactions will require delivery of instructions
to the relevant European international clearing system by the counterparty in such system in accordance with its rules
and procedures and within its established deadlines, in European time. The relevant European international clearing
system will, if the transaction meets its settlement requirements, deliver instructions to its U.S. Depositary to take
action to effect final settlement on its behalf by delivering interests in the Notes to or receiving interests in the Notes
from the Depositary, and making or receiving payment in accordance with normal procedures for same-day funds
settlement applicable to the Depositary. Clearstream, Luxembourg Customers and Euroclear Participants may not
deliver instructions directly to their respective U.S. Depositaries.

Because of time-zone differences, credits of interests in the Notes received in Clearstream, Luxembourg or Euroclear
as a result of a transaction with a DTC participant will be made during subsequent securities settlement processing and
dated the business day following the Depositary settlement date. Such credits or any transactions involving interests in
such Notes settled during such processing will be reported to the relevant Clearstream, Luxembourg Customers or
Euroclear Participants on such business day. Cash received in Clearstream, Luxembourg or Euroclear as a result of
sales of interests in the Notes by or through a Clearstream, Luxembourg Customer or a Euroclear Participant to a DTC
participant will be received with value on the Depositary settlement date but will be available in the relevant
Clearstream, Luxembourg or Euroclear cash account only as of the business day following settlement in the
Depositary.

Although the Depositary, Clearstream, Luxembourg and Euroclear have agreed to the foregoing procedures in order to
facilitate transfers of interests in the Notes among participants of the Depositary, Clearstream, Luxembourg and
Euroclear, they are under no obligation to perform or continue to perform such procedures and such procedures may
be changed or discontinued at any time.
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Certain Tax Considerations

United States Taxation

General

This section summarizes the material U.S. federal tax consequences of the acquisition, ownership and disposition of
the Notes. However, the discussion is limited in the following ways:

� The discussion only covers you if you buy your Notes in the initial offering at the price set forth on the cover page
and you hold your Notes as capital assets (that is, for investment purposes).

� This discussion does not address all tax considerations that may be relevant to you in light of your personal
investment circumstances or to certain categories of investors that may be subject to special rules, such as:

� financial institutions;

� tax-exempt organizations;

� insurance companies;

� dealers in securities or foreign currencies;

� persons holding the Notes as part of a hedge, straddle or conversion transaction or other integrated transaction;

� U.S. Holders whose functional currency is not the U.S. dollar; or

� partnerships or other entities treated as partnerships for U.S. federal income tax purposes.

� The discussion is based on current law. Changes in the law may change the tax treatment of the Notes possibly with
a retroactive effect.

� The discussion does not cover any tax consequences arising under U.S. federal gift, estate or alternative minimum
tax laws or under the laws of any state, local or foreign jurisdiction.

� We have not requested a ruling from the United States Internal Revenue Service (the �IRS�) on the tax consequences
of owning and disposing of the Notes. As a result, the IRS could disagree with portions of this discussion.

IF YOU ARE CONSIDERING BUYING NOTES, WE SUGGEST THAT YOU CONSULT YOUR TAX ADVISOR
ABOUT THE TAX CONSEQUENCES OF HOLDING THE NOTES IN YOUR PARTICULAR SITUATION AS
WELL AS ANY TAX CONSEQUENCES ARISING UNDER THE LAWS OF ANY STATE, LOCAL OR
FOREIGN JURISDICTION.

Tax Consequences to U.S. Holders

This section applies to you if you are a �U.S. Holder.� A �U.S. Holder� is a beneficial owner of a Note that is for
U.S. federal income tax purposes:
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� a corporation�or entity taxable as a corporation for U.S. federal income tax purposes�that was created or organized
under U.S. law (federal or state);

� an estate whose world-wide income is subject to U.S. federal income tax; or

� a trust, if (a) a court within the United States is able to exercise primary supervision over administration of the trust
and one or more United States persons have authority to control all substantial decisions of the trust or (b) it has a
valid election in effect under applicable U.S. Treasury regulations to be treated as a domestic trust.

If a partnership (or other entity treated as a partnership for U.S. federal income tax purposes) holds Notes, the tax
treatment of a partner will generally depend upon the status of the partner and upon the activities of the partnership. If
you are a partner of a partnership holding Notes, we suggest that you consult your tax advisor.

Interest

� If you are a cash method taxpayer (including most individual holders), you must report interest on the Notes as
ordinary income when you receive it.

� If you are an accrual method taxpayer, you must report interest on the Notes as ordinary income as it accrues.

Disposition of Notes

On your sale, exchange, redemption or other taxable disposition of your Note:

� You will have taxable gain or loss equal to the difference between the amount received by you and your tax basis in
the Note. Your tax basis in the Note is your cost, subject to certain adjustments.

� Your gain or loss will generally be capital gain or loss, and will be long term capital gain or loss if you held the
Note for more than one year. For an individual, the current maximum tax rate on long term capital gains is 15%.

� If you sell the Note between interest payment dates, a portion of the amount you receive reflects interest that has
accrued on the Note but has not yet been paid by the sale date. That amount is treated as ordinary interest income as
described above under ��Interest.�

Information Reporting and Backup Withholding

Under the tax rules concerning information reporting to the IRS:

� Assuming you hold your Notes through a broker or other securities intermediary, the intermediary must provide
information to the IRS and to you on IRS Form 1099 concerning interest and retirement proceeds on your Notes as
well as on proceeds from sale or other disposition of the Notes, unless an exemption applies.

� Similarly, unless an exemption applies, you must provide the intermediary with your Taxpayer Identification
Number for its use in reporting information to the IRS. If you are an individual, this is your social security number.
You are also required to comply with other IRS requirements concerning information reporting.
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� If you are subject to these requirements but do not comply, the intermediary must withhold at a rate that is currently
28% of all amounts payable to you on the Notes (including principal payments and sale proceeds). This is called
�backup withholding�. If the intermediary withholds payments, you may use the withheld amount as a credit against
your federal income tax liability.

� All individuals are subject to these requirements. Some holders, including all corporations, tax-exempt
organizations and individual retirement accounts, are exempt from these requirements.

Tax Consequences to Non-U.S. Holders

This section applies to you if you are a �Non-U.S. Holder.� A �Non-U.S. Holder� is a beneficial owner of a Note that is
not a U.S. Holder. As stated above, if a partnership (or other entity treated as a partnership for U.S. federal income tax
purposes) holds Notes, the tax treatment of a partner will generally depend upon the status of the partner and upon the
activities of the partnership. If you are a partner of a partnership holding Notes, we suggest that you consult your tax
advisor.

Withholding Taxes

Generally, payments of principal and interest on the Notes will not be subject to U.S. withholding taxes.

However, in the case of interest, for the exemption from withholding taxes to apply to you, you must meet one of the
following requirements:

� You provide a completed Form W-8BEN (or substitute form) to the bank, broker or other intermediary through
which you hold your Notes. The Form W-8BEN contains your name, address and a statement that you are the
beneficial owner of the Notes and that you are not a U.S. Holder.

� You hold your Note directly through a �qualified intermediary,� and the qualified intermediary has sufficient
information in its files indicating that you are not a U.S. Holder. A qualified intermediary is a bank, broker or other
intermediary that (1) is either a U.S. or non-U.S. entity, (2) is acting out of a non-U.S. branch or office and (3) has
signed an agreement with the IRS providing that it will administer all or part of the U.S. tax withholding rules under
specified procedures.

� You are entitled to an exemption from withholding tax on interest under a tax treaty between the U.S. and your
country of residence. To claim this exemption, you must generally complete Form W-8BEN and claim this
exemption on the form.

� The interest income on the Notes is effectively connected with the conduct of your trade or business in the U.S., and
is not exempt from U.S. tax under a tax treaty. To claim this exemption, you must complete Form W-8ECI.

Even if you meet one of the above requirements, interest paid to you will be subject to withholding tax under any of
the following circumstances:

� The withholding agent or an intermediary knows or has reason to know that you are not entitled to an exemption
from withholding tax. Specific rules apply for this test.
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� The IRS notifies the withholding agent that information that you or an intermediary provided concerning your status
is false.

� An intermediary through which you hold the Notes fails to comply with the procedures necessary to avoid
withholding taxes on the Notes.

� You own 10% or more of the voting stock of Johnson & Johnson, are a �controlled foreign corporation� related
directly or indirectly to Johnson & Johnson through stock ownership, or are a bank making a loan in the ordinary
course of its business. In these cases, you will be exempt from withholding taxes only if you are eligible for a treaty
exemption or if the interest income is effectively connected with your conduct of a trade or business in the U.S. and
you provide us with a properly executed form W-8ECI as discussed above.

The rules regarding withholding are complex and vary depending on your individual situation. They are also subject
to change. In addition, special rules apply to certain types of Non-U.S. Holders of Notes, including partnerships, trusts
and other entities treated as pass-through entities for U.S. federal income tax purposes. We suggest that you consult
with your tax advisor regarding the specific methods for satisfying these requirements.

Sale of Notes

If you sell a Note, you will not be subject to U.S. federal income tax on any gain unless one of the following applies:

� The gain is effectively connected with a trade or business that you conduct in the U.S. (and, if certain tax treaties
apply, is attributable to a U.S. permanent establishment).

� You are an individual, you are present in the U.S. for at least 183 days during the taxable year in which you dispose
of the Note, and certain other conditions are satisfied.

� The gain represents accrued interest, in which case the rules for interest would apply.

U.S. Trade or Business

If you hold your Note in connection with a trade or business that you are conducting in the U.S. (and, if certain tax
treaties apply, is attributable to a U.S. permanent establishment):

� Any interest on the Note, and any gain from disposing of the Note, generally will be subject to income tax as if you
were a U.S. Holder.

� If you are a corporation, you may be subject to the �branch profits tax� on your earnings that are connected with your
U.S. trade or business, including earnings from the Note. This tax rate is 30%, but may be reduced or eliminated by
an applicable income tax treaty.

Information Reporting and Backup Withholding

U.S. rules concerning information reporting and backup withholding are described above. These rules apply to
Non-U.S. Holders as follows:

� Principal and interest payments you receive will be automatically exempt from the usual rules if you provide the tax
certifications needed to avoid withholding tax on interest, as described above under ��Withholding Taxes�. The
exemption does not apply if the withholding agent or an intermediary knows or has reason to know that you should
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information reporting or backup withholding rules. In addition, interest payments made to you will generally be
reported to the IRS on Form 1042-S.

� Sale proceeds you receive on a sale of your Notes through a broker may be subject to information reporting and/or
backup withholding if you are not eligible for an exemption. In particular, information reporting and backup
reporting may apply if you use the U.S. office of a broker, and information reporting (but not backup withholding)
may apply if you use the foreign office of a broker that has certain connections to the U.S. In general, you may file
Form W-8BEN to claim an exemption from information reporting and backup withholding. We suggest that you
consult your tax advisor concerning information reporting and backup withholding on a sale.

European Union Tax Reporting and Withholding

Directive 2003/48/EC (the �Directive�) of the Council of the European Union relating to the taxation of savings income,
became effective on July 1, 2005. Under the Directive, if a paying agent for interest on a debt claim is resident in one
member state of the European Union and an individual who is the beneficial owner of the interest is a resident of
another member state, then the former member state is required to provide information (including the identity of the
recipient) to authorities of the latter member state. �Paying agent� is defined broadly for this purpose and generally
includes any agent of either payor or payee. Belgium, Luxembourg and Austria have opted instead to withhold tax on
the interest during a transitional period (initially at a rate of 15% but rising in steps to 35% after six years), subject to
the ability of the individual to avoid withholding tax through voluntary disclosure of the investment to the individual�s
member state. In addition, certain non-members of the European Union (Switzerland, Liechtenstein, Andorra, Monaco
and San Marino), as well as dependent and associated territories of the United Kingdom and the Netherlands, have
adopted equivalent measures effective on the same date, and some (including Switzerland) have exercised the option
to apply withholding taxes as described above.
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Underwriting

Under the terms and subject to the conditions in the underwriting agreement dated the date of this Prospectus
Supplement, we have agreed to sell to each of the underwriters named below, and each of the underwriters has
severally and not jointly agreed to purchase, the principal amount of each series of Notes that appears opposite its
name in the table below:
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