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REDWOOD TRUST, INC.
One Belvedere Place, Suite 300
Mill Valley, California 94941
(415) 389-7373

NOTICE OF 2019 ANNUAL MEETING OF STOCKHOLDERS

To the Stockholders of Redwood Trust, Inc.:

You are cordially invited to attend the Annual Meeting of Stockholders of Redwood Trust, Inc., a Maryland
corporation, to be held on May 15, 2019 at 8:30 a.m., local time, at the Acqua Hotel, 555 Redwood Highway, Mill
Valley, California 94941, for the following purposes:

1.
To elect Richard D. Baum, Christopher J. Abate, Mariann Byerwalter, Douglas B. Hansen, Debora D. Horvath,
Greg H. Kubicek, Fred J. Matera, Jeffrey T. Pero, and Georganne C. Proctor to serve as directors until the Annual
Meeting of Stockholders in 2020 and until their successors are duly elected and qualify;

2.To ratify the appointment of Grant Thornton LLP as our independent registered public accounting firm for 2019;
3.To vote on a non-binding advisory resolution to approve named executive officer compensation;
4.To vote on an amendment to our charter to increase the number of shares authorized for issuance;

5.To vote on the amendment to our 2002 Employee Stock Purchase Plan to increase the number of shares authorizedfor issuance; and

6.To transact such other business as may properly come before the Annual Meeting or any adjournment orpostponement of the Annual Meeting.
We have elected to use the Internet as our primary means of providing our proxy materials to stockholders.
Consequently, stockholders will not receive paper copies of our proxy materials unless they specifically request them.
We will send a Notice of Internet Availability of Proxy Materials (the Notice) on or about April 5, 2019 to our
stockholders of record as of the close of business on March 21, 2019. We are also providing access to our proxy
materials over the Internet beginning on April 5, 2019. Electronic delivery of our proxy materials will reduce printing
and mailing costs relating to our Annual Meeting.
The Notice contains instructions for accessing the proxy materials, including the Proxy Statement and our annual
report, and provides information on how stockholders may obtain paper copies free of charge. The Notice also
provides the date and time of the Annual Meeting; the matters to be acted upon at the Annual Meeting and the Board’s
recommendation with regard to each matter to be acted upon; and information on how to attend the Annual Meeting
and vote online.
Our Board of Directors has fixed the close of business on March 21, 2019 as the record date for determination of
stockholders entitled to notice of, and to vote at, the Annual Meeting and any adjournment or postponement of the
Annual Meeting.
We would like your shares to be represented at the Annual Meeting. Whether or not you plan to attend the Annual
Meeting, we respectfully request that you authorize your proxy over the Internet following the voting procedures
described in the Notice. In addition, if you have requested or received a paper or email copy of the proxy materials,
you can authorize your proxy over the telephone or by signing, dating and returning the proxy card sent to you. We
encourage you to authorize your proxy by any of these methods even if you currently plan to attend the Annual
Meeting. By doing so, you will ensure that your shares are represented and voted at the Annual Meeting.

By Order of the Board of Directors,

/s/ Andrew P. Stone
Secretary
April 5, 2019
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YOUR VOTE IS IMPORTANT.

PLEASE PROMPTLY AUTHORIZE A PROXY TO CAST YOUR VOTES THROUGH THE INTERNET
FOLLOWING THE VOTING PROCEDURES DESCRIBED IN THE NOTICE OR, IF YOU HAVE REQUESTED
AND RECEIVED PAPER COPIES OF THE PROXY MATERIALS, BY TELEPHONE OR BY SIGNING,
DATING AND RETURNING THE PROXY CARD SENT TO YOU.
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REDWOOD TRUST, INC.
One Belvedere Place, Suite 300
Mill Valley, California 94941
(415) 389-7373

PROXY STATEMENT
ANNUAL MEETING OF STOCKHOLDERS
TO BE HELD ON MAY 15, 2019 

INTRODUCTION

This Proxy Statement is being furnished in connection with the solicitation of proxies by the Board of Directors of
Redwood Trust, Inc., a Maryland corporation (Redwood, the Company, we, or us), for exercise at the Annual Meeting
of Stockholders (the Annual Meeting) to be held on Wednesday, May 15, 2019 at 8:30 a.m., local time, at the Acqua
Hotel, 555 Redwood Highway, Mill Valley, California 94941, and at any adjournment or postponement thereof.

We have elected to provide access to our proxy materials over the Internet. Accordingly, we are sending a Notice of
Internet Availability of Proxy Materials (the Notice) to our stockholders of record, while brokers and other nominees
who hold shares on behalf of beneficial owners will be sending their own similar Notice of Internet Availability of
Proxy Materials. All stockholders will have the ability to access proxy materials on the website referred to in the
Notice or request to receive a printed set of the proxy materials. Instructions on how to request a printed copy by mail
or electronically may be found on the Notice and on the website referred to in the Notice, including an option to
request paper copies on an ongoing basis. We intend to make this Proxy Statement available on the Internet on or
about April 5, 2019 and to mail the Notice to all stockholders entitled to vote at the Annual Meeting on or about April
5, 2019. We intend to mail this Proxy Statement, together with a proxy card, to those stockholders entitled to vote at
the Annual Meeting who have properly requested paper copies of such materials on or about April 5, 2019 or within
three business days of such request.

The address and telephone number of our principal executive office are as set forth above and our website is
www.redwoodtrust.com. Information on our website is not a part of this Proxy Statement.

1
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INFORMATION ABOUT THE ANNUAL MEETING

Who May Attend the Annual Meeting

Only stockholders who own our common stock as of the close of business on March 21, 2019, the record date for the
Annual Meeting, will be entitled to attend the Annual Meeting. In the discretion of management, we may permit
certain other individuals to attend the Annual Meeting, including members of the media and our employees.

Who May Vote

Each share of our common stock outstanding on the record date for the Annual Meeting entitles the holder thereof to
one vote. The record date for determining stockholders entitled to notice of, and to vote at, the Annual Meeting is the
close of business on March 21, 2019. As of March 21, 2019, there were 96,659,250 shares of common stock issued
and outstanding. You can vote in person at the Annual Meeting or by proxy. You may authorize your proxy through
the Internet by following the voting procedures described in the Notice or, if you have requested and received paper
copies of the proxy materials, by telephone or by signing, dating, and returning the proxy card sent to you. To use a
particular voting procedure, follow the instructions on the Notice or the proxy card that you request and receive by
mail or email.

If your shares are held in the name of a bank, broker, or other holder of record, you will receive instructions from the
holder of record that you must follow in order for your shares to be voted. If your shares are not registered in your
own name and you plan to cast your votes in person at the Annual Meeting, you should contact your broker or agent to
obtain a broker’s proxy card and bring it to the Annual Meeting in order to vote.

Voting by Proxy; Board of Directors’ Voting Recommendations

You may authorize your proxy over the Internet or, if you request and receive a proxy card by mail or email, over the
phone or by signing, dating and returning the proxy card sent to you. If you vote by proxy, the individuals named on
the proxy, or their substitutes, will cast your votes in the manner you indicate. If you date, sign, and return a proxy
card without marking your voting instructions, your votes will be cast in accordance with the recommendations of
Redwood’s Board of Directors, as follows:

•For the election of each of the nine nominees to serve as directors until the Annual Meeting of Stockholders in 2020and until their successors are duly elected and qualify;

•For the ratification of the appointment of Grant Thornton LLP as our independent registered public accounting firmfor 2019;
•For the approval of the non-binding advisory resolution approving the compensation of our named executive officers;
•To vote on an amendment of our charter to increase the number of shares authorized for issuance;

•To vote on an amendment to our 2002 Employee Stock Purchase Plan to increase the number of shares authorized forissuance; and
•In the discretion of the proxy holder on any other matter that properly comes before the Annual Meeting.
You may revoke or change your proxy at any time before it is exercised by submitting a new proxy through the
Internet or by telephone, delivering to us a signed proxy with a date later than your previously delivered proxy, by
voting in person at the Annual Meeting, or by sending a written revocation of your proxy addressed to Redwood’s
Secretary at our principal executive office.

2
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Why did I receive a one-page notice in the mail regarding the Internet availability of proxy materials instead of a full
set of proxy materials?

Under rules adopted by the Securities and Exchange Commission (SEC), we have elected to provide access to our
proxy materials over the Internet. Accordingly, we are sending the Notice to our stockholders. All stockholders will
have the ability to access the proxy materials on the website referred to in the Notice or request to receive a printed set
of the materials. Instructions on how to access the proxy materials over the Internet or to request a printed copy may
be found in the Notice. In addition, stockholders may request to receive proxy materials in printed form by mail or
electronically by email on an ongoing basis. We encourage stockholders to take advantage of the availability of the
proxy materials on the Internet to help reduce printing and mailing costs relating to our Annual Meeting.

Quorum Requirement

The presence, in person or by proxy, of stockholders entitled to cast a majority of all the votes entitled to be cast at the
Annual Meeting constitutes a quorum for the transaction of business. Abstentions and broker non-votes are counted as
present for purposes of establishing a quorum. A broker non-vote occurs when a nominee holding shares for a
beneficial owner has not received instructions from the beneficial owner and does not have discretionary authority to
vote the shares.

Other Matters

Our Board of Directors knows of no other matters that may be presented for stockholder action at the Annual Meeting.
If other matters properly come before the Annual Meeting, however, it is intended that the persons named in the
proxies will vote on those matters in their discretion.

Information About the Proxy Statement and the Solicitation of Proxies

Your proxy is solicited by our Board of Directors and we will bear the costs of this solicitation. Proxy solicitations
will be made by mail, and also may be made by our directors, officers, and employees in person or by telephone,
facsimile transmission, e-mail, or other means of communication. Banks, brokerage houses, nominees, and other
fiduciaries will be requested to forward the proxy soliciting material to the beneficial owners of shares of our common
stock entitled to be voted at the Annual Meeting and to obtain authorization for the execution of proxies on behalf of
beneficial owners. We will, upon request, reimburse those parties for their reasonable expenses in forwarding proxy
materials to their beneficial owners.

In addition, we have retained MacKenzie Partners, Inc., 1407 Broadway, 27th Floor, New York, NY 10018, to aid in
the solicitation of proxies by mail, telephone, facsimile, e-mail and personal solicitation and to contact brokerage
houses and other nominees, fiduciaries and custodians to request that such entities forward soliciting materials to
beneficial owners of our common stock. For these services, we will pay MacKenzie Partners, Inc. a fee not expected
to exceed $15,000, plus expenses.

Annual Report

Our 2018 Annual Report, consisting of our Annual Report on Form 10-K for the year ended December 31, 2018, is
being made available to stockholders together with this Proxy Statement and contains financial and other information
about Redwood, including audited financial statements for our fiscal year ended December 31, 2018. Certain sections
of our 2018 Annual Report are incorporated into this Proxy Statement by reference, as described in more detail under
“Information Incorporated by Reference” at the end of this Proxy Statement. Our 2018 Annual Report is also available
on our website.
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Householding

We have adopted a procedure approved by the SEC called “householding.” Under this procedure, stockholders of record
who have the same address and last name will receive only one copy of the Notice, unless one or more of these
stockholders notifies us that they wish to continue receiving individual copies. This procedure reduces our printing
and mailing costs.

Householding will not in any way affect dividend check mailings.

If you are eligible for householding, but you and other stockholders of record with whom you share an address
currently receive multiple copies of the Notice, or if you hold stock in more than one account, and in either case you
wish to receive only a single copy of this document for your household, please contact our transfer agent,
Computershare Trust Company, N.A., either in writing at: Computershare Investor Services, 250 Royall Street,
Canton, MA 02021; or by telephone at: (888) 472-1955.

If you participate in householding and wish to receive a separate copy of the Notice, or if you do not wish to
participate in householding and prefer to receive separate copies of this document in the future, please contact
Computershare as indicated above.

Beneficial owners can request information about householding from their banks, brokers, or other holders of record.

4
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CORPORATE GOVERNANCE

Corporate Governance Standards

Our Board of Directors has adopted Corporate Governance Standards (Governance Standards). Our Governance
Standards are available on our website as well as in print at the written request of any stockholder addressed to
Redwood’s Secretary at our principal executive office. The Governance Standards contain general principles regarding
the composition and functions of our Board of Directors and its committees.

Process for Nominating Potential Director Candidates

Identifying and Evaluating Nominees for Directors.  Our Board of Directors nominates director candidates for election
by stockholders at each annual meeting and elects new directors to fill vacancies on our Board of Directors between
annual meetings of the stockholders. Our Board of Directors has delegated the selection and initial evaluation of
potential director nominees to the Governance and Nominating Committee with input from the Chief Executive
Officer and President. The Governance and Nominating Committee makes the final recommendation of candidates to
our Board of Directors for nomination. Our Board of Directors, taking into consideration the assessment of the
Governance and Nominating Committee, also determines whether a nominee would be an independent director.

Stockholders’ Nominees.  Our Bylaws permit stockholders to nominate a candidate for election as a director at an
annual meeting of the stockholders subject to compliance with certain notice and informational requirements, as more
fully described below in this Proxy Statement under “Stockholder Proposals for the 2020 Annual Meeting.” A copy of
the full text of our Bylaws may be obtained by any stockholder upon written request addressed to Redwood’s Secretary
at our principal executive office. Among other matters required under our Bylaws, any stockholder nominations
should include the nominee’s name and qualifications for Board membership and should be addressed to Redwood’s
Secretary at our principal executive office.

The policy of the Governance and Nominating Committee is to consider properly submitted stockholder nominations
for candidates for election to our Board of Directors. The Governance and Nominating Committee evaluates
stockholder nominations in connection with its responsibilities set forth in its written charter and applies the
qualification and diversity criteria set forth in the Governance Standards.

Director Qualifications.  Our Governance Standards contain Board membership criteria that apply to nominees for our
Board of Directors. Each member of our Board of Directors must exhibit high standards of integrity, commitment, and
independence of thought and judgment, and must be committed to promoting the best interests of Redwood. In
addition, each director must devote the time and effort necessary to be a responsible and productive member of our
Board of Directors. This includes developing knowledge about Redwood’s business operations and doing the work
necessary to participate actively and effectively in Board and committee meetings.

Our Governance Standards also contain criteria that are intended to guide our Governance and Nominating
Committee’s considerations of diversity in identifying nominees for our Board of Directors. In particular, our
Governance Standards provide that the members of our Board of Directors should collectively possess a broad range
of talent, skill, expertise, and experience useful to effective oversight of our business and affairs and sufficient to
provide sound and prudent guidance with respect to our operations and interests. The self-assessments that are
conducted each year by our Board of Directors and our Governance and Nominating Committee include an
assessment of whether the Board’s then current composition represents the broad range of talent, skill, expertise, and
experience that is called for by our Governance Standards.
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We believe our directors have a well-rounded variety of diversity, skills, qualifications and experience, and represent
an effective mix of deep company knowledge and outside perspectives. Additional information regarding the mix of
experience, qualifications, attributes and skills of our directors is included under Item 1 Election of Directors on pages
11-16 of this Proxy Statement.

Director Independence

As required under Section 303A of the New York Stock Exchange (NYSE) Listed Company Manual and our
Governance Standards, our Board of Directors has affirmatively determined that none of the following directors has a
material relationship (either directly or as a partner, shareholder, or officer of an organization that has a relationship)
with us and that each of them qualifies as “independent” under Section 303A: Richard D. Baum, Douglas B. Hansen,
Mariann Byerwalter, Debora D. Horvath, Greg H. Kubicek, Karen R. Pallotta, Jeffrey T. Pero, and Georganne C.
Proctor. The Board of Directors’ determination was made with respect to Mr. Pero after consideration of the following:
Mr. Pero is a retired partner of Latham & Watkins LLP and has been a director of Redwood since November 2009;
Latham & Watkins LLP provides legal services to Redwood; and Mr. Pero’s retirement payments from Latham &
Watkins LLP are adjusted to exclude any proportionate benefit received from the fees paid by Redwood to Latham &
Watkins LLP.

Two members of our Board of Directors, Mr. Abate and Mr. Matera, do not qualify as “independent” under Section
303A of the NYSE Listed Company Manual or our Governance Standards. Mr. Abate does not qualify as independent
because he is Redwood's Chief Executive Officer. Mr. Matera does not qualify as independent because he served,
within the last three years, as an executive officer at Redwood.

Board Leadership Structure

At Redwood, there is a separation of the chairman and chief executive officer roles. The Chairman of the Board of
Directors presides over meetings of the Board and serves as a liaison between the Board and management of
Redwood. In addition, the Chairman provides input regarding Board agendas, materials, and areas of focus, and may
represent Redwood to external constituencies such as investors, governmental representatives, and business
counterparties. The Chairman is currently Richard D. Baum, who was elected Chairman in September 2012 and who
has continuously served as an independent director of Redwood since 2001.

In addition, under the Governance Standards, each of the Audit Committee, Compensation Committee, and
Governance and Nominating Committee of Redwood’s Board of Directors is comprised solely of independent directors
as members.

The Board believes this leadership structure is appropriate for Redwood, as it provides for the Board to be led by, and
its standing committees to be comprised of, independent directors. As an independent Chairman of the Board, Mr.
Baum brings more than a decade of experience of serving on Redwood’s Board along with the important perspective of
an independent director to this leadership position.

Executive Sessions

Our Governance Standards require that our non-employee directors (i.e., the nine of our 10 current directors who are
not Redwood employees) meet in executive session at each regularly scheduled quarterly meeting of our Board of
Directors and at such other times as determined by our Chairman. In addition, if any non-employee director is not also
an independent director, then our Governance Standards require that our independent directors meet at least annually
in executive session without any such non-independent directors.
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Board of Directors’ Role in Risk Oversight

The Board of Directors takes a primary role in risk oversight. At its regular meetings, the Board of Directors reviews
Redwood’s business and investment strategies and plans and seeks an understanding of the related risks as well as
management’s approach to identifying and managing those risks. In carrying out its role in risk oversight, the Board of
Directors receives and discusses quarterly reports from the Chief Executive Officer and Audit Committee, which also
carries out a risk oversight function delegated by the Board of Directors.

Under its charter, the Audit Committee is specifically charged with (i) inquiring of management and Redwood’s
independent registered public accounting firm about significant risks or exposures with respect to corporate
accounting, reporting practices of Redwood, the quality and integrity of the financial reports and controls of Redwood,
regulatory and accounting initiatives, and any off-balance sheet structures and (ii) assessing the steps management has
taken to minimize such risks. In addition, the Audit Committee is specifically charged with regularly discussing with
management Redwood’s policies with respect to risk assessment and risk management, including identification of
Redwood’s major financial and operational risk exposures and the steps management has taken to monitor or control
those exposures. For example, the Audit Committee receives quarterly reports from management regarding various
financial risk management topics (such as interest rate risk, liquidity risk, and counterparty risk), and various
operational risk management topics (such as cybersecurity, operations and regulatory compliance) and regularly
discusses with management Redwood's exposure to, and management of, financial and operational risks.

The Audit Committee carries out this function by, among other things, receiving a quarterly risk management report
from Redwood’s Chief Executive Officer and other Redwood officers, and a quarterly internal audit report from
Redwood’s head of internal audit, reviewing these reports, and discussing them by asking questions and providing
direction to management. In addition, as noted below under “Audit Committee Matters — Audit Committee Report,” the
Audit Committee also receives and discusses regular and required communications from Redwood’s independent
registered public accounting firm regarding, among other things, Redwood’s internal controls. In addition to discussion
of these reports during Audit Committee meetings, as circumstances merit, the Audit Committee holds separate
executive sessions with one or more of the Chief Executive Officer, Redwood’s head of internal audit, and
representatives of Redwood’s independent registered public accounting firm to discuss any matters that the Audit
Committee or these persons believe should be discussed in the absence of other members of management. Redwood's
head of internal audit and the Chair of the Audit Committee also regularly communicate between Audit Committee
meetings.

In addition, when appropriate, the Board of Directors may delegate to the Compensation Committee and Governance
and Nominating Committee risk oversight responsibilities with respect to certain matters or request that other
committees review certain risk oversight matters. For example, the Compensation Committee has been delegated the
responsibility for determining, on an annual basis, whether Redwood’s compensation policies and practices are
reasonably likely to have a material adverse effect on Redwood. As another example, the Governance and Nominating
Committee reports to the Board of Directors the results of its analysis of potential risks related to board leadership and
composition, board structure, and executive succession planning.

The Board of Directors believes that this manner of administering the risk oversight function effectively integrates
oversight into the Board of Directors’ leadership structure, because the risk oversight function is carried out both at the
Board level as well as through delegation to the Audit Committee, which consists solely of independent directors, and
when appropriate to the Compensation Committee and Governance and Nominating Committee, which also consist
solely of independent directors.

7
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Board of Directors’ Self-Evaluation Process

The Board believes it is important to periodically assess its own performance and effectiveness in carrying out its
strategic and oversight role with respect to the Company. The Board evaluates its performance through annual
self-assessments at the Board and Committee levels, as well as through annual individual director self-assessments
that include one-on-one meetings conducted by the Chairman with each of the other directors (or, with respect to the
Chairman, the Chair of the Governance and Nominating Committee). These self-assessments include analysis of the
effectiveness of the Board, its Committees and its directors, how they are functioning and areas of potential
improvement. The results of these performance reviews are also considered, among other things, by the Governance
and Nominating Committee and the Board when considering whether to recommend a director for re-election and
whether to consider new director candidates.

Communications with the Board of Directors

Stockholders and other interested parties may communicate with our Board of Directors by e-mail addressed to
boardofdirectors@redwoodtrust.com. The Chairman has access to this e-mail address and provides access to other
directors as appropriate. Communications that are intended specifically for non-employee directors should be
addressed to the Chairman.

Director Attendance at Annual Meetings of Stockholders

Pursuant to our Governance Standards, our directors are expected to attend annual meetings of stockholders. All of
our directors attended last year’s annual meeting of stockholders in person. We currently expect all directors nominated
for election to attend this year’s Annual Meeting.

Code of Ethics

Our Board of Directors has adopted a Code of Ethics that applies to all of our directors, officers, and employees. Our
Code of Ethics is available on our website as well as in print at the written request of any stockholder addressed to
Redwood’s Secretary at our principal executive office.

We intend to post on our website and disclose in a Current Report on Form 8-K, to the extent required by applicable
regulations, any change to the provisions of our Code of Ethics and any waiver of a provision of the Code of Ethics.

8
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STOCK OWNERSHIP REQUIREMENTS

Required Stock Ownership by Directors

Pursuant to our Governance Standards, non-employee directors are required to purchase from their own funds at least
$50,000 of our common stock within three years from the date of commencement of their Board membership. Vested
deferred stock units (DSUs) acquired by a director under our Executive Deferred Compensation Plan through the
voluntary deferral of cash compensation that otherwise would have been paid to that director are counted towards this
requirement. Any director whose status has changed from being an employee director to being a non-employee
director is not subject to this requirement if that director held at least $50,000 of our common stock at the time of that
change in status.

Additionally, since May 2018, non-employee directors are required to own at least $425,000 of our common stock,
including vested DSUs acquired through both voluntary and involuntary deferred compensation, within five years
from the date of commencement of their Board membership. Stock and DSUs acquired with respect to the $50,000
stock purchase requirement count toward the attainment of this additional stock ownership requirement. Compliance
with the ownership requirements is measured on a purchase/acquisition cost basis.

As of the date of this Proxy Statement, all of our non-employee directors were in compliance with these requirements
either due to ownership of the requisite number of shares or because the director was within the time period permitted
to attain the required level of ownership.

Required Stock Ownership by Executive Officers

The Compensation Committee of our Board of Directors has set the following executive stock ownership
requirements with respect to our executive officers:

•
Each executive officer is required to own stock with a value at least equal to (i) six times current salary for the Chief
Executive Officer, (ii) three times current salary for the President, and (iii) two times current salary for the other
executive officers;

•

Three years are allowed to initially attain the required level of ownership and three years are allowed to acquire
additional incremental shares if promoted to a position with a higher requirement or when a salary increase results in a
higher requirement (if not in compliance at the indicated times, then the executive officer is required to retain net
after-tax shares delivered as compensation or from the Executive Deferred Compensation Plan until compliance is
achieved);

•All shares owned outright are counted, including those held in trust for the executive officer and his or her immediatefamily, as well as vested DSUs and any other vested s
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